

					VENDOR ---->	EVERYTHING MEDICAL dba UNITED HEALTH SUPPLIES	MOORE MEDICAL	
ITEM #	EST. ANN. USE	ITEM DESCRIPTION	AGENCY'S STOCK # (IF WANTING TO INCLUDE IN BID)	UOM - COMMENT S	BID ITEM DETAIL (BRAND, ITEM # - LEAD-TIME)	Bid Pricing	BID ITEM DETAIL (BRAND, ITEM # - LEAD-TIME)	Bid Pricing
1.00		ANTISEPTICS, OINTMENTS, SOAPS & SOLUTIONS						
1.01	80	ALCOHOL PREPS - MEDIUM. INDIVIDUALLY PACKAGED. 200 PER BOX. DUKAL 0852, KENDALL #6818, ABCO #818080, MEDLINE INSTA-PREP #09-0730, OR APPROVED EQUIV.	WPS - 001521351 BVS 54.29646	/ BX	Dukal D22-0852	\$1.31	98721	\$1.17
1.02	348	ALCOHOL, ISOPROPYL - 16 OZ./BOTTLE. YORK #1209, CSI #1156-10, GOODSENSE OR APPROVED EQUIV.	BVS 54.29650 MAPLETON	/ BTL	Green Labs X935814	\$1.19	81768	\$1.20
1.03	20	ANTISEPTIC CREAM, 1-1/2 OZ - <i>JOHNSON & JOHNSON - FIRST AID 4509 - DISC.</i>	BVS 54.29670	/TB	Abbig Labs 560-79720	\$1.49	72040	\$2.05
1.04	36	ANTISEPTIC WIPES OR TOWLETTES (BENZALKONIUM CHLORIDE) - INDIVIDUALLY PACKAGED. 100 PACKETS PER BOX. MOORE # 68535, KENDALL, ABCO, MEDLINE, OR APPROVED EQUIV.	WPS - 001521360	/ BX	Dynarex D70-1303	\$1.39	97947 Moore	\$1.38
1.05	67	EYE WASH SOLUTION - 4 OZ. BOTTLE. STERILE ISOTONIC BUFFERED SOLUTION. ALTAIR LABS # 175-35, FM #782904, OPTOPICS IRRIGATE, OR APPROVED EQUIV.	POUDRE	/ BTL	Altaire Labs A85-17535	\$1.59	75519	\$1.52
1.06	40	HAND SANITIZER, 4 OZ. BOTTLE	MAPLETON	/ BTL	Chester Labs C82-11226	\$0.76	88098	\$1.05
1.07	1186	PURELL HAND SANITIZER, 8 OZ PUMP BOTTLE. GOJO # 9652-650-F	WPS - 000000130 POUDRE	/ BTL	Purell G99-9652	\$3.29	71597	\$3.25
1.08	10	PURELL INSTANT HAND SANITIZER, GALLON CONTAINER. - NO AWARD - NO BID FOR THIS BRAND OR SIZE.	POUDRE	/ BTL	No Bid		77160 2 liter	\$18.98
1.09	30	HYDROGEN PEROXIDE - 16 FLUID OUNCE BOTTLES.	MAPLETON POUDRE	/ BTL	Good Sense P90-VJ	\$0.65	92997	\$0.46
1.10	65	LICE SHAMPOO, HEAD - 2 OZ. SIZED BOTTLE. RID BRAND	SVVS - 1501500 MAPLETON	/ BTL	Rid B50-412	\$6.60	91116 BSH 4 OZ	\$2.67
1.11	230	PETROLEUM JELLY, WHITE - 1 OZ./TUBE. DONOVAN # PJ4326, FOUGERA #0168-0053-21-093766, VASELINE, OR EQUIV.	WPS - 001521490 MAPLETON POUDRE	/ TB	Donovan (Dukal) D22-4326 - 2 oz	\$0.69	98396	\$0.73
1.12	116	PETROLEUM JELLY, WHITE - 3 1/4 OZ TUBES, MOORE # 8622, VASELINE # 08622 OR EQUIV.	BVS 54.29670 MAPLETON	/ TB	Vaseline S22-4303 7-10 DYS	\$0.93	98396 4 OZ	\$0.73
1.13	63	SOAP, LIQUID, ANTI-BACTERIAL, 7.5 OZ WITH PUMP. DIAL ONLY - # 62331.	MAPLETON	/ EA	Dial d12-84014	\$2.09	62331	\$2.30
1.14	37	SOAP, LIQUID, ANTI-BACTERIAL, GALLON REFILL. DIAL ONLY - # 37696.	MAPLETON	/ EA	Dial D12-88047	\$10.85	37696	\$11.79
1.15	32	CLEANSER, HIBICLENS (8 OZ)	POUDRE	/ EA	Hibiclens M20-57508	\$5.95	11125	\$5.93
1.16	120	OINTMENT, FIRST AID ANTIBIOTIC, BACITRACIN, 1 OZ CREAM.	POUDRE	/ TB	Medpride M15-30354	\$1.79	49117	\$1.37
1.17	NEW ADD	SOAP, LIQUID, 8 OZ BOTTLE .	WPS - 001521540	/ EA	DUKAL D22-BG08	\$0.79		

					VENDOR ---->	EVERYTHING MEDICAL dba UNITED HEALTH SUPPLIES	MOORE MEDICAL	
ITEM #	EST. ANN. USE	ITEM DESCRIPTION	AGENCY'S STOCK # (IF WANTING TO INCLUDE IN BID)	UOM - COMMENT S	BID ITEM DETAIL (BRAND, ITEM # - LEAD-TIME)	Bid Pricing	BID ITEM DETAIL (BRAND, ITEM # - LEAD-TIME)	Bid Pricing
1.18	NEW ADD	SOAP, LIQUID, GALLON REFILL.	WPS - 001521545	/ EA	DUKAL D22- BG128	\$9.60		
2.00		BANDAIDS AND BANDAGES						
2.01	10	BANDAGE, BUTTERFLY - 1", WATERPROOF. (FABRIC PREFERRED.) APPROX. 100 PER CARTON. J&J, ABCO, OR APPROVED EQUIVALENT. *PLEASE SPECIFY WHETHER BIDDING FABRIC OR PLASTIC.* ***MUST BE LATEX FREE***	SVVS 1500410	/ CTN	White Cross W16-1975	\$1.39	68207 100/bx Plastic	\$1.97
2.02	50	BANDAGE, FINGERTIP - 1" (FABRIC PREFERRED.) APPROX. 100 PER BOX. / APPROX. 24 BOXES PER CARTON. J&J, ABCO, OR APPROVED EQUIV. *PLEASE SPECIFY WHETHER BIDDING FABRIC OR PLASTIC. ***MUST BE LATEX FREE***	MAPLETON POUDRE	/ BX - FABRIC - PLASTIC	Careband A22- 4025 Fabric, 100/bx, 12/cs	\$2.85	68187 100/bx Fabric Moore	\$1.12
2.03	91	BANDAGE, TRIANGLE - COTTON. J&J #8068, QMD # TB40 OR APPROVED EQUIV.	WPS - 001521532 MAPLETON POUDRE	/ BX	Medsource M55- TB40	\$0.32	92750	\$0.26
2.04	120	BANDAGES - "JUNIOR" SIZED STRIPS. 1/2" WIDE X 1-1/2" LONG APPROX.. FABRIC STRIPS, 100 PER BOX. J&J, CAREBAND # 2088LF, ABCO, OR APPROVED EQUIV. ***MUST BE LATEX FREE***	WPS - 001521371 MAPLETON	/ BX	Careband A22- 2088LF Plastic only.	\$0.72	No Bid	
2.05	1570	BANDAGES - 1" WIDE X 3" LONG APPROX. <u>FABRIC STRIPS</u> , 100 PER BOX. ABCO #057402, J&J, NUTRAMAX # 99990 OR APPROVED EQUIV. ***MUST BE LATEX FREE***	WPS - 001521378 SVVS - 1500300 MAPLETON POUDRE	/ BX	NutraMax (White Cross) W16- 1595	\$1.52	72884 Derma Science	\$1.51
2.06	1049	BANDAGES - 1" WIDE X 3" LONG APPROX. <u>PLASTIC</u> - MOORE MEDICAL # 68189 100 PER BOX. ABCO #057402, J&J, OR APPROVED EQUIV. ***MUST BE LATEX FREE***	BVS 54.29654 MAPLETON POUDRE	/BX	Carband A22- 2019	\$1.15	68189 Moore	\$1.29
2.07	379	BANDAGES - 2" WIDE X 4" LONG APPROX. "EXTRA LARGE", FABRIC STRIPS, 50 PER BOX. J&J #5716, DYNAREX # 3614, ABCO, OR APPROVED EQUIV. ***MUST BE LATEX FREE***	WPS - 001521385 SVVS - 1500302 MAPLETON POUDRE	/ BX	Careband A22- 2016	\$2.09	68188 Moore	\$2.15
2.08	541	BANDAGES - 3/4" WIDE X 2-1/2" LONG APPROX., FABRIC STRIPS, 100 PER BOX. J&J, DYNAREX # 3611, ABCO #057401, BDF #32-019, BDRF #0231, CHS #6514, OR APPROVED EQUIV. ***MUST BE LATEX FREE***	WPS - 001521392 POUDRE	/ BX	Careband A22- 4018	\$1.42	68182 Moore	\$1.46
2.09	50	BANDAGES - 3/4" WIDE X 3" LONG, 100 PER BOX. LATEX FREE - SCHOOL HEALTH # 32101 OR EQUIV.	MAPLETON	/ BX	White Cross W16-1580	\$1.42	68182 Moore	\$1.46
2.10	142	BANDAGE - FLEXIBLE, COHESIVE, NON-LATEX, 2"x2.2 YDS UNSTRETCHED; 2"x5 YDS STRETCHED CO-FLEX OR EQUIV.	POUDRE	/ EA	Dynarex D70- 3188	\$0.79	79414 6/bx Moore = \$.5316 ea.	\$3.19 / CS
2.11	53	BAND-AID DOTS, ROUND WATER RESISTANT DRESSING COVERLET	POUDRE	/ BOX	Coverlet B22- 0301	\$3.72	08079 100/bx	\$3.66
2.12	230	BANDAID, 80 ASSORTED FABRIC SHEER, LATEX FREE, STERILE - ASSORTED SIZES: 3/4"x3", 1"x3", 5/8"x2-1/4".	POUDRE	/ BOX	White Cross W16-1280	\$1.15	53371 Derma Science	\$1.34

					VENDOR ---->	EVERYTHING MEDICAL dba UNITED HEALTH SUPPLIES	MOORE MEDICAL	
ITEM #	EST. ANN. USE	ITEM DESCRIPTION	AGENCY'S STOCK # (IF WANTING TO INCLUDE IN BID)	UOM - COMMENT S	BID ITEM DETAIL (BRAND, ITEM # - LEAD-TIME)	Bid Pricing	BID ITEM DETAIL (BRAND, ITEM # - LEAD-TIME)	Bid Pricing
2.13	325	BANDAGES, BAND-AIDS - STRIPS. 3/8" X 1-1/2" WITH PAD, FABRIC STRIPS, 100 PER CARTON *PLEASE SPECIFY CARTON PACK* ***MUST BE LATEX FREE!!***	SVVS - 1500304 MAPLETON	/ CTN	White Cross W16-1298 - Plastic only - 100/ctn 12/cs	\$0.72	No Bid	
2.14	100	SHEER MINI STRIPS, 3/8"X1" LATEX FREE, 100/BOX, ITEM A22-2088ASO CAREBAND SHEER ADHESIVE STRIP BANDAGES, OR EQUIV.	POUDRE	./BX	ASO Careband A22-2088LF	\$0.72	68273 Dynarex	\$0.87
3.00		COLD / HOT PACKS						
3.01	50	BAG, "ZIPLOCK TYPE", 6" X 6" 100/BOX OR PKG. ELKAY GOLD SEAL # G14-0606, MEDICAL ACTION # 0606 OR EQUIV. (**PRIMARY USE - FOR ICE TO BE USED FOR MINOR INJURIES**)	WPS - 001521365	/ PKG	Medical Action G14-0606	\$1.75	No Bid	
3.02	195	COLD PACK - REUSABLE / FLEXIBLE. 6" X 9" APPROX. CRAMER #032746 ONLY. **NO SUBSTITUTES!!**	WPS - 000030533	./ EA	Cramer C99-032746	\$1.29	55627	\$1.50
3.03	739	COLD PACK, INSTANT - 4" X 6", MOORE # 59797.	POUDRE	./EA	Briggs DMI T99-ICE62	\$0.31	79451	\$0.25
3.04	521	COLD PACK, REGULAR, 5-1/2" X 7", 16/BX, KWIK KOLD # 107 - **NO SUBSTITUTE**	BVS 54.29676 POUDRE	/ BX	Kwik Kold B16-107 16/bx	\$11.70	89511	\$8.94
3.05	252	HOT / COLD PACK - REUSABLE GEL PACK. 5-1/2" X 8-1/2". (12 EACH PER CASE). MICRO BIO-MEDICS #PN730, OR APPROVED EQUIV.	POUDRE SVVS W1500501	./ EA	Total Resources T99-GEL476	\$0.71	80547	\$1.00
3.06	705	COLD PACK - DISPOSABLE 3-3/4" X 6" MOORE # 79450 OR EQUIV. (10 PER CASE)	WPS - 000030530 POUDRE	./ EA	Briggs DMI T99-ICE62 10/cs = \$2.990 ea.	\$2.99	79450	\$1.93
3.07	606	COLD/HOT COMPRESS, SMALL, NON LATEX, REUSABLE, NON TOXIC, STAYS SOFT, HOSPITAL PROVEN, CONFORMING WHEN FROZEN OR HEATED. 3-3/4"X6" APROX., THERMA COOL TK46 OR EQUIV.	POUDRE	./ EA	ThermaKool N12-46100	\$0.69	80546	\$0.60
4.00		CUPS						
4.01	185	CUPS, PAPER - PLEATED 3.5 OZ. 100 CUPS PER TUBE. (50 TUBES PER CASE - FULL CASE QUANTITIES ONLY) FITS IN CUP DISPENSERS - LILY OR SOLO #450 ONLY - ** NO SUBSTITUTES!! **	WPS - 000005371	./ TB	SOLO 450 U12-0450 7-10 DYS	\$2.29	No Bid	
5.00		FIRST AID KIT REFILLS						
5.01	20	FIRST AID KIT - VEHICLE - 70 ITEMS, DESIGNED FOR VEHICLE USE. EXAMPLE: BAND-AIDS, GAUZE PADS, ETC.	POUDRE	/ KIT	No Bid		30323	\$18.12
6.00		GLOVES, EXAM - DISPOSABLE						
6.01	172	GLOVES, MEDICAL EXAM - NON-STERILE. ***MUST BE NON-LATEX / LATEX FREE!!*** DISPOSABLE, POWDER-FREE, 100 GLOVES PER BOX. SIZE SMALL ONLY. CYPRESS - MOORE # 77104 OR APPROVED EQUIV.	WPS - 000001248 MAPLETON POUDRE	./ BX	Shamrock EGVVPS VINYL PF	\$2.90	77104 Moore	\$3.51

					VENDOR ---->	EVERYTHING MEDICAL dba UNITED HEALTH SUPPLIES	MOORE MEDICAL	
ITEM #	EST. ANN. USE	ITEM DESCRIPTION	AGENCY'S STOCK # (IF WANTING TO INCLUDE IN BID)	UOM - COMMENT S	BID ITEM DETAIL (BRAND, ITEM # - LEAD-TIME)	Bid Pricing	BID ITEM DETAIL (BRAND, ITEM # - LEAD-TIME)	Bid Pricing
6.02	2066	GLOVES, MEDICAL EXAM - NON-STERILE. ***MUST BE NON-LATEX / LATEX FREE!*** DISPOSABLE, POWDER-FREE , 100 GLOVES PER BOX, SIZE MEDIUM SHAMROCK # 20212, EVERGREEN # EVGPFM, DASH, P.E., MRK, ABCO, OR APPROVED EQUIV.	WPS - 000001250 BVS 54.29679 SVVS W1501315 MAPLETON	/ BX	Shamrock EGVPFM VINYL PF	\$2.90	77105 Moore	\$3.51
6.03	2336	GLOVES, MEDICAL EXAM - NON-STERILE. ***MUST BE NON-LATEX / LATEX FREE!*** DISPOSABLE, POWDER-FREE , 100 GLOVES PER BOX. SIZE LARGE ONLY . SHAMROCK# 20213, EVERGREEN # EGVPL - 20213, DASH, P.E., MRK, ABCO, OR APPROVED EQUIV.	WPS - 000001252 BVS 54.29592 SVVS W1501325 MAPLETON	/ BX	Shamrock EGVPFL VINYL PF	\$2.90	77106 Moore	\$3.51
6.04	200	GLOVES, SURGICAL, XL, 100/BOX, DISPOSABLE, POWDER FREE. SHAMROCK 20214.	BVS 54.29557	/ BX	Shamrock EGVPFXL	\$2.90	77107 non sterile	\$3.51
6.05	400	GLOVES, SURE CARE (OR EQUIV) NITRILE EXAMINATION, LATEX AND POWDER FREE, CHEMICAL RESISTANT, 10 BOXES/CASE, MEDIUM.	SVVS W2850300	/ BX	Shamrock EGNPFM	\$4.95	74396 Moore	\$3.88
6.06	550	GLOVES, SURE CARE (OR EQUIV) NITRILE EXAMINATION, LATEX AND POWDER FREE, CHEMICAL RESISTANT, 10 BOXES/CASE, LARGE.	SVVS W2850305	/ BX	Shamrock EGNPFL	\$4.95	74397 Moore 100/bx	\$3.88
6.07	NEW ADD	GLOVES, MEDICAL EXAM - NON-STERILE. ***MUST BE NON-LATEX / LATEX FREE!*** DISPOSABLE, POWDER-FREE , 100 GLOVES PER BOX. SIZE X-LARGE ONLY . SHAMROCK# 20213, EVERGREEN # EGVPFXL - 20213, DASH, P.E., MRK, ABCO, OR APPROVED EQUIV.	WPS - 000001254	/ BX	Shamrock EGVPFXL VINYL PF	\$2.90		
7.00		SPLINTS & ELASTIC BANDAGES						
7.01	30	ELASTIC BANDAGE, 4" X 5 YDS. TETRA # 131-40.	BVS - 54-29667 MAPLETON POUDRE	/ RL	Elastex E20-EB4	\$0.41	99039 Cypress	\$0.38
7.02	241	ELASTIC BANDAGE, FLEXIBLE - ECONOMY. 2" WIDE X 5 YARDS PER ROLL APPROX. WITH TWO CLIPS INCLUDED. ***MUST BE LATEX FREE!*** ACE, CYPRESS # 83637 OR APPROVED EQUIV.	WPS - 001521417 SVVS 1500401 POUDRE	/RL	QMD E20- EB2LF	\$0.69	99037 Cypress	\$0.28
7.03	228	ELASTIC BANDAGE, FLEXIBLE - ECONOMY. 3" WIDE X 5 YARDS PER ROLL APPROX. WITH TWO CLIPS INCLUDED. ACE, ELASTEX EB3 OR APPROVED EQUIV.	WPS - 001521419 SVVS - 1500402 MAPLETON POUDRE	/ RL	Elastex E20- EB3	\$0.32	99038 Cypress	\$0.35
7.04	87	ELASTIC BANDAGE, FLEXIBLE - ECONOMY. 4" WIDE X 5 YARDS PER ROLL APPROX. WITH TWO CLIPS INCLUDED.	SVVS - 1500403 MAPLETON	/ RL	Elastex E20-EB4	\$0.41	99039 Cypress	\$0.38
7.05	17	SPLINT, ARM - 12" X 6" TRI-FOLD CARDBOARD WITH SPONGE PADDING. (FOLDS IN TWO PLACES TO FORM HALF BOX TROUGH -> _ <-FOR INJURED LIMB.) SWIFT #43-1007, MOORE # 79686 OR APPROVED EQUIV.	WPS - 001521555 MAPLETON	/ EA	Dynarex D70- 3624	\$1.19	79686 Moore	\$1.82
7.06	12	SPLINT, FINGER - ALUMINUM WITH SPONGE PADDING. FOUR PRONG TYPE. ALUMAFOAM # SML 42342 - MOORE # 88932. OR APPROVED EQUIV.	WPS - 001521562	/ EA	AlumaFoam C36- 6722	\$1.98	88932 DJ Ortho	\$0.75

					VENDOR ---->	EVERYTHING MEDICAL dba UNITED HEALTH SUPPLIES	MOORE MEDICAL	
ITEM #	EST. ANN. USE	ITEM DESCRIPTION	AGENCY'S STOCK # (IF WANTING TO INCLUDE IN BID)	UOM - COMMENT S	BID ITEM DETAIL (BRAND, ITEM # - LEAD-TIME)	Bid Pricing	BID ITEM DETAIL (BRAND, ITEM # - LEAD-TIME)	Bid Pricing
7.07	8	SPLINT, LEG - 18" X 8" APPROX. TRI-FOLD CARDBOARD WITH SPONGE PADDING. (FOLDS IN TWO PLACES TO FORM HALF BOX TROUGH -> _ <- FOR INJURED LIMB.) MOORE # 79685, SWIFT #43-1008 OR APPROVED EQUIV.	WPS - 001521569 MAPLETON	./ EA	Dynarex D70-3625	\$1.79	79685 Moore	\$2.09
8.00		SWABS, GAUZE, PADS, AND TAPE						
8.01	3	APPLICATOR, COTTON TIPPED, COTTON WOUND ONE END, NON-STERILE, 6" LENGTH, 1000/BX, MOORE MEDICAL # 32262 OR APPROVED EQUIV.	BVS 54.29703 POUDRE	./BX	Dynarex D70-4302	\$3.30	69620 Moore	\$3.66
8.02	46	APPLICATOR, COTTON TIPPED, NON-STERILE, 6" LENGTH, 100/PKG. MOORE MEDICAL # 69620 OR EQUIV.	POUDRE	./BX	Dynarex D70-4302-100	\$0.37	69620 1000/bx Moore	\$3.66
8.03	101	COTTON BALLS, MEDIUM SIZED. NON-STERILE. 2000 BALLS PER BAG. ABCO #053028, DUKAL 0801, OR APPROVED EQUIV.	WPS - 001521399 SVVS 1500605	./ BG	Dynarex D70-3170	\$5.95	92796 American Fiber	\$4.69
8.04	50	COTTON BALLS, NON-STERILE. 130/pkg SCHOOL HEALTH 30004 OR APPROVED EQUIV.	BVS - 54.9704	./BG	CURAD M66-110163 - Sterile	\$2.95	84696 300/bag Moore	\$0.80
8.05	33	COTTON SWABS - DOUBLE OR SINGLE TIPPED (SINGLE TIPPED PREFERRED - PLEASE SPECIFY WHICH YOU ARE BIDDING) 3" LENGTH APPROX. HARDWOOD SHAFT, 100 TO 180 PER BOX OR PACK. (PLEASE SPECIFY PACK SIZE), NON-STERILE, MOORE # 69621, ABCO #220361 OR APPROVED EQUIV.	WPS - 001521406 SVVS 1500221	./ PK	Dynarex D70-4302 - sgl tip, 100/pkg	\$0.28	69621 single tip 100/pkg. 10 pks/bx. Moore	\$2.67
8.06	102	COTTON SWABS, STERILE - SINGLE TIPPED, 3" LENGTH APPROX. HARDWOOD SHAFT, 100 TO 180 PER BOX OR PACK. (PLEASE SPECIFY PACK SIZE), DUKAL # 9013 OR APPROVED EQUIV.	WPS - 001521410 MAPLETON POUDRE	./ PK	Dynarex D70-4304 100/pkg	\$2.39	69621 single tip 100/pkg. 10 pks/bx Moore	\$2.67
8.07	15	FLEXICON (ELASTIC GAUZE) - 1" X 5 YARDS PER ROLL. INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED, *MUST BE STERILE* FLEXICON #1910 OR APPROVED EQUIV.	WPS - 001521427 SVVS 1501221	./ RL	Flexicon C36-1910	\$0.45	83818 12/bx \$.3708 ea.	\$4.45
8.08	34	FLEXICON (ELASTIC GAUZE) - 2" X 5 YARDS PER ROLL. INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED, *MUST BE STERILE* FLEXICON #1920, DYNAREX # 3112 OR APPROVED EQUIV.	WPS - 001521434 SVVS 1501223 POUDRE	./ RL	Dynarex D70-3112	\$0.29	80876 12/bg. Moore \$.0875 ea.	\$1.05
8.09	6	FLEXICON - 3" X 4.5 YDS, STERILE, MOORE # 49177 QMD # GBS6, OR EQUIV.	WPS - 001521436	./RL	QMV Q12-6BS3	\$0.30	80877 12/bg Moore \$.1058 ea	\$1.27
8.10	130	GAUZE BANDAGE, 2" X 5 YDS, STERILE, KENDALL CONFORM 2260.	BVS - 54.29649 MAPLETON	./BX	QMD Q12-6BS-2	\$1.90	80876 12/pkg. Moore \$.0875 ea	\$1.05
8.11	14	GAUZE PADS - 2" X 2" STERILE. INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED. 100 PER BOX OR CARTON. DUKAL # 1212, MOORE # 08250 OR EQUIV.	WPS - -01521441 SVVS 1501202	./ BX	Dynarex D70-3352 - 7-10DYS	\$2.10	08250 100/bx Moore	\$2.07
8.12	100	GAUZE PADS - 3" X 3" NON-STERILE, 12 PLY, 200/PKG, KENDALL 2346.	BVS - 64.29645	./PKG	Kendall K10-441219	\$1.88	12277 200 / pkg. Moore	\$2.70
8.13	11	GAUZE PADS - 3" X 3" STERILE. INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED, 100 PER BOX OR PACKAGE. DYNAREX # 3353, KENDALL #6132, OR APPROVED EQUIV.	WPS - 001521448 SVVS 1501201	./ BX	Dynarex D70-3353 7-10 DYS	\$3.15	08251 100/bx. Moore	\$3.26

					VENDOR ---->	EVERYTHING MEDICAL dba UNITED HEALTH SUPPLIES	MOORE MEDICAL	
ITEM #	EST. ANN. USE	ITEM DESCRIPTION	AGENCY'S STOCK # (IF WANTING TO INCLUDE IN BID)	UOM - COMMENT S	BID ITEM DETAIL (BRAND, ITEM # - LEAD-TIME)	Bid Pricing	BID ITEM DETAIL (BRAND, ITEM # - LEAD-TIME)	Bid Pricing
8.14	5	GAUZE PADS - 4" X 4" STERILE. INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED. 50 PER BOX OR CARTON. DYNAREX 3354 OR EQUIV.	WPS - 001521455	./ BX	Dynarex D70-3354-50	\$4.75	08252 100/bx. Moore	\$5.20
8.15	10	GAUZE PADS - STERILE. INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED. 100 PER BOX , KENDALL 2132 - 3" X 4"	BVS - 54.29674	./BX	Kendall K10-2132	\$12.65	74088 50/bx. Dukal (X2 = \$4.52)	\$2.26
8.16	100	GAUZE PADS, NON-STICK - 2" X 3" INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED, STERILE. 100 PER BOX. KENDALL 6017 **ADHESIVE **	BVS - 54.29672	./BX	Kendall K10-6017	\$9.70	93063 100/bx. Derma Science	\$5.88
8.17	22	PADS, TELFA NON-ADHERENT, 3" X 4" (50/PKG). SWIFT # S60-35034, WHITE CROSS W16-7575 OR EQUIV.	WPS - 001521670 SVVS W1502001	./ EA	White Cross W16-7575 - 100/pkg.	\$5.30	10776 100/bx. Moore	\$5.49
8.18	60	PRE-TAPING UNDERWRAP, 2 3/4" X 30 YDS, 48 / CS, <i>JOHNSON & JOHNSON 5185 - disc.</i>	BVS - 54.29692 SVVS W1502101	./CS	Cramer C99-214592 48/cs	\$33.95		No Bid
8.19	68	SPONGE, GAUZE, 2" X 2" NON-STERILE. 200 PER BOX OR PACKAGE. DYNAREX # 3222, KENDALL, OR APPROVED EQUIV.	WPS - 001521504 POUDRE	./ PK.	Kendall K10-442308	\$0.89	94641 200/pkg. Dukal	\$1.36
8.20	105	SPONGE, GAUZE, NON-STERILE, 3" X 3" 12 PLY, 200/PK.	MAPLETON POUDRE	./PKG	Kendall K10-441219	\$1.88	94642 200/pkg. Dukal	\$2.68
8.21	227	TAPE, ADHESIVE, 1" X 10 YARDS APPROX. WHITE, POROUS. ALL PURPOSE, BLEACHED WHITE COTTON TAPE. J&J OR APPROVED EQUIV.	BVS 54.29647 SVVS 150.2410 MAPLETON POUDRE	./BX	J+J J18-5104 12/bx	\$12.40	08215 12/bx. Moore \$.6108 ea	\$7.33
8.22	20	TAPE, HYPOALLERGENIC, 1 X 10 YDS, CLOTH, LATEX-FREE, 12 RL / CS., DYNAREX # 79817 OR EQUIV.	WPS - 001521492	./RL	Hyposilk H20-7111	\$7.79	79817 12/cs Dynarex	\$6.65
8.23	10	TAPE, HYPOALLERGENIC, 1/2 X 10 YDS, CLOTH, LATEX-FREE, J&J DERMICEL, 24 RL / CS	MAPLETON	./BX	Hyposilk H20-7110	\$7.79	79816 24/cs. Dynarex	\$6.65
8.24	6	TAPE, MEDICAL ADHESIVE, 2" -HYPOSILK # DYNAREX 79818 (6 ROLLS/BOX).	WPS - 001521494	./RL/	Hyposilk H20-7112	\$7.79	79818 6/bx. Dynarex	\$6.65
8.25	59	TAPE, PLASTIC - 1/2" WIDE X 15 YARDS PER ROLL. HYPO-ALLERGENIC. AMD 260780, DERMACLEAR, 3M TRANSPORE #M1527-0 OR EQUIV.	WPS - 001521497 SVVS 150.2408	./ RL	HypoClear H20-8110 1/2"x10 yds	\$0.29	71568 24/bx Dukal \$.23 ea.	\$5.52
8.26	50	TAPE, STANDARD POROUS - 1" X 10 YARDS PER ROLL. CURITY #2531, KENDALL, JOHNSON & JOHNSON 85160 OR APPROVED EQUIV.	BVS - 54.29647	./ RL	Kendall K10-2531C	\$0.94	08215 12/bx. Moore \$.6108 ea	\$7.33
8.27	5	TAPE, ATHLETIC, 1 1/2" X 15 YDS, 32 / CS, JOHNSON & JOHNSON 5188 - *NO SUBSTITUTE*	SVVS W1502403	./CS	J+J J18-5188 32/cs	\$49.95	48293 J+J	\$52.41
9.00		THERMOMETERS & THERMOMETER SHEATHS						
9.01	3	TEMPA-DOT, SINGLE USE. CLINICAL THERMOMETER (100/BOX)	WPS - 001521518	./ BOX	NexTemp M40-1112	\$8.95	15444 100/bx	\$10.31

					VENDOR ---->	EVERYTHING MEDICAL dba UNITED HEALTH SUPPLIES	MOORE MEDICAL	
ITEM #	EST. ANN. USE	ITEM DESCRIPTION	AGENCY'S STOCK # (IF WANTING TO INCLUDE IN BID)	UOM - COMMENT S	BID ITEM DETAIL (BRAND, ITEM # - LEAD-TIME)	Bid Pricing	BID ITEM DETAIL (BRAND, ITEM # - LEAD-TIME)	Bid Pricing
9.02	30	THERMOMETER PROBE COVERS, EAR - 100 PER BOX APPROX. PROBE COVERS USED IN CONJUNCTION WITH FirstTemp GENIUS ELECTRONIC EAR THERMOMETERS #386-480 ONLY **NO SUBSTITUTES!!**	MAPLETON	/ BX	Genius K10-303030-96/bx	\$6.30 =>	discontinued by mfgr	No Bid
9.03	18	THERMOMETER SHEATHS - UNIVERSAL SIZE. *MUST FIT THERMOMETERS LISTED BELOW!* 100 SHEATHS PER BOX. STANDARD DIGITAL THERMOMETER. MABIS # 15-618-000, ABCO #078120, BD #4035, SANITHERM #21-051. ADC # 63347 OR EQUIV.	WPS - 001521525 SVVS 150.2441	/ BX	Sanitherm M12-D100-2	\$1.65	63347 100/bx ADC	\$1.58
9.04	60	PROBE COVERS, WELCH ALLY DIGITAL PROBE PROTECTORS # 05031 - 250 / BOX ONLY	POUDRE	/ BX	Welch Allyn T40-05031	\$8.60	17737 250/bx.	\$8.65
9.05	6	THERMOMETER, DIGITAL ONLY. ORAL BD, ADC 93511, OR EQUIV.	WPS - 001521511	/ EA	Lumiscope G24-1858	\$2.10	93511 1/ea.	\$1.63
10.00		MISCELLANEOUS SUPPLIES						
10.01	50	CPR MICROSHIELD PLUS MEDICAL DEVICES INTERNATIONAL # 76-345 *NO SUBSTITUTE*	BVS - 54.29700	/EA	CPR Microshield M30-70150	\$4.45	58194 MDI 1/ea.	\$6.22
10.02	39	CPR POCKET MASK - LAERDAL #83 00 03, MOORE # 73508 OR APPROVED EQUIV.	WPS - 001521413	/ EA	Medsource M55-PM104	\$5.50	73508 1/ ea. Moore	\$3.41
10.03	2	FACE MASKS, (50 / BOX) - MOORE # 82665, MEDICAL ACTION # M10-2115, DYNAREX 2201 OR APPROVED EQUIV..	WPS - 001521423	/ BOX	Medical Action W22-99905	\$3.25	82665 50/bx. Moore	\$2.81
10.04	338	PAPER COT ROLLS (TABLE PAPER) - 18" WIDE X 225 FEET PER ROLL APPROX. WHITE PREFERRED. AVALON PAPER # 513, ABC #583182, OR APPROVED EQUIV.	WPS - 001521483 MAPLETON POUDRE	/ RL	Avalon A20-513	\$2.29	76998 - 1 / rl. Tidi	\$2.07 EA \$24.84 CS
10.05	6	SAFETY PINS - #1. APPROX. 1" LENGTH. 144 / PKG.	WPS - 000015641	/ PKG	Grafco G24-3039-1C	\$0.95	85883	\$0.99
10.06	6	SAFETY PINS - #2. APPROX. 1-1/2" LENGTH. 144/PKG.	WPS - 000015659	/ PKG	Grafco G24-3039-2C	\$1.18	85884	\$1.12
10.07	87	SHARPS DISPOSAL DEVICE, 1 QUART. MEDICAL ACTION # W22-8702, KENDALL # 34982 OR APPROVED EQUIV.	WPS - 001521400 POUDRE SVVS W1502310	/ EA	Medical Action W22-8702	\$1.39	93266 Moore - ea	\$1.00
10.08	30	SPLINTER FORCEPS, TWEEZERS, POINTED, 4 1/2" SCHOOL HEALTH 36-047	BVS - 70.94368 MAPLETON	/EA	Myco M54-0833	\$0.69	77274	\$0.75
10.09	23	TONGUE DEPRESSORS, EXAM - NON-STERILE. STANDARD SIZE. 500 PER BOX. DYNAREX D70-4312, ABCO #220320, MOORE # 69617, OR EQUIV.	WPS - 001521528 BVS - 54.29688 SVVS 150.2451	/ BX	Dynarex D70-4312	\$3.45	69617 500/bx. Moore	\$4.13
10.10	68	TONGUE DEPRESSORS, JUNIOR, 5-1/2", BOX	POUDRE	/ BX	Dynarex D70-4311 500/bx	\$3.30	69616 500/bx. Moore	\$3.71
10.11	63	TRIANGLE ARM SLING, 35" X 35" X 50", INCLUDES 2 SAFETY PINS.	POUDRE	/EA	QMD Q12TB37	\$0.32	92750 ea.	\$0.26

VENDOR ---->					EVERYTHING MEDICAL dba UNITED HEALTH SUPPLIES	MOORE MEDICAL		
ITEM #	EST. ANN. USE	ITEM DESCRIPTION	AGENCY'S STOCK # (IF WANTING TO INCLUDE IN BID)	UOM - COMMENT S	BID ITEM DETAIL (BRAND, ITEM # - LEAD-TIME)	Bid Pricing	BID ITEM DETAIL (BRAND, ITEM # - LEAD-TIME)	Bid Pricing
10.12	335	WIPES, 8" X 14", PERSONAL WASHCLOTHS, 50 / TUB, *NOT ANTISEPTIC - SAFE FOR FACES* DONOVAN D14-8150 OR APPROVED EQUIV.	WPS - 001521680	/ TUB	Donovan (Dukal) D14- 8150	\$1.99	22994 64/tub - 8 tubs/case Dukal	\$28.11
			COMMENTS		Delivery 7-10 days for all items.			
contact information for awarded vendors: - - >>					Everything Medical LLC dba United Health Supplies; Robert Kelemen PO Box 33958 Las Vegas, NV 89133 (800) 201-0806 Fax(702) 227-9534 bob@UHSEM.COM		Moore Medical Susan Mosley (800) 234-1464 Fax(877) 354-5916 smosley@ mooremedical.com REFERENCE MOORE MEDICAL BID # 835165 ON ALL ORDERS.	
ENTITY CODE LISTING	WESTMINSTER PUBLIC SCHOOLS (WPS), ADAMS 12 FIVE STAR SCHOOLS (A12), BOULDER VALLEY PUBLIC SCHOOLS (BVS), ST. VRAIN VALLEY SCHOOLS (SVVS), MAPLETON, POUFRE							
OTHER CITIES / DISTRICTS:	INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO: ADAMS 1, ADAMS 14, ADAMS 27J, ARVADA, AURORA, BRIGHTON, CHERRY CREEK, COLORADO SPRINGS, DENVER, DOUGLAS COUNTY, ENGLEWOOD, FORT COLLINS, GREELEY, JEFFERSON COUNTY, LAKEWOOD, LITTLETON, LONGMONT, LOVELAND, NORTHGLENN, POUFRE, ST. VRAIN VALLEY, THOMPSON, THORNTON, WELD COUNTY SCHOOLS, WHEAT RIDGE							